
 

Heartfelt
300-18 Smoke

$82.00/yard

300-18 - Smoke 300-83 - Wood Ash

APPLICATION

 

Upholstery, wrapped panel

**Please see Heartfelt 828 for
more colorways of this quality.
Piece dyed.

CONTENT  100% wool

WIDTH  54"

REPEAT  None

WEIGHT  17.60 ounces per linear yard

FINISH  None

BACKING  None

ABRASION  50,000 double rubs (W)

ORIGIN  United States

FLAME RESISTANCE

 

Class A rated ASTM E-84
(unadhered), NFPA 260
(UFAC Class 1), California TB
117-2013 Section 1 (Pass)

MAINTENANCE

 

S: Clean with water free dry
cleaning solvent

SUSTAINABILITY

 

100% rapidly renewable
content. Third party certified,
SCS Indoor Advantage™
Gold. Meets BIFMA 7.4.4.

Based on disclosure from the
supplier this product does not
contain harmful chemicals
listed on the Red List.

Free of intentionally added
PFAS chemicals. For inquiries
or requests for specific skus
with PFAS-Free inventory,
please contact
hbftextilesservice@hbf.com.
For more info refer to our
PFAS-Free Patterns - FAQ
(PDF) listed under "other"



 

downloads on this detail page.

NOTES

 

Please see Heartfelt 828 for
more colorways of this quality.
Piece dyed.

* Specific colors on sale and
only available while supplies
last.

PRICE | GRADE  $82.00 | HBF Grade K

ACT REGISTERED
CERTIFICATION  

    

PRICE LIST  Go to price list

DOWNLOAD

 

Fabric Product Documents
Maintenance
Sustainability Statement
Sustainability Certification
Summary
SCS Indoor Advantage™
Certificate
Sustainable Contents

OTHER

 

Other
Media Kit
News & Events
Presentation
PFAS-Free Patterns - FAQ
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